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The Swiss Academy of Sciences celebrated its bicen-
tennial in 2015, including a publication covering the 

-
zerland (Die ERDE 146 (2-3): 205-207). As a follow-
up, the historical developments that led to the Swiss 

governmental institution was investigated by Fran-
ziska Hupfer who presents an easy to read and eluci-
dating book covering the time period from 1860 to 
1914, by when the meteorological observations were 
systematically established across Switzerland as a 

were carried out by Johann Jakob Scheuchzer in 1708, 
but in comparison to other European countries con-
certed meteorological observations were not well es-
tablished in Switzerland during the 18th century. The 

identical instruments in 1760 to people in various re-
gions of the Canton of Bern, but all incentives to keep 
such systematic meteorological observations active 
over longer time periods failed sooner or later. Only in 
1860 did the Swiss Academy of Sciences take the deci-
sion to foster the organisation of regular meteorologi-
cal observations across the whole country. In the be-
ginning of this new era, the Astronomic Observatory 
of Bern played a key role, given the experience it had 
gained from previous work in the canton. These ac-
tivities were on purely private and academic grounds. 

collection (as the basis for climatological characteri-
sations) towards a public service in the hands of the 
government, the political framework was an impor-
tant factor, as Hupfer emphasizes.

Switzerland in its present form was founded in 1848. 
Thus, 1848 marks the beginning of the successful de-
velopment of modern Switzerland. Originally, this was 
a weak construct, but it was well understood that it 
was time to move weather observations from the level 
of the states (i.e., the cantons) to the national level in 
order to make them more consistent and more compa-
rable, primarily across the country, but increasingly 
so also in the international context.

The Swiss Academy of Sciences guided the early deve-
lopments with its Board of Experts (Meteorologische 
Kommission) with the goal to provide the relevant cli-
matological information to the farmers in a still pre-

however, the board was strictly against the ‘unscien-
-

ties of the weather service. However, its director had 
the clear vision of the usefulness of weather forecasts 
for farmers and the wider public, despite the question-
able reputation these forecasts had within the scien-

-
cial demand from taxpayers can only be operated suc-
cessfully, if the general public has a use of its products. 
Early weather forecasts struggled with the complex 
topography of Switzerland and the associated vague 

local farmers still relied more on their own predictive 

weather, or the 100-year calendar which suggested 
that weather patterns will repeat themselves every 
seven years. Hupfer nicely elaborates on the tensions 
between the Board of Experts which tried to restrict 

observations, versus the political and governmental 
bodies that saw the potential value of weather obser-
vations, including forecasts, and the climatological 
knowledge gained via long-term observations. This 
lead to the transition of the authority guiding the me-

Hupfer also elucidates important side-aspects of the 
-

tion experiments carried out between 1901 and 1906 
to prevent hail damages in sensitive agricultural set-
tings. She selected the case of the orographically right 
shore of the Lake of Zurich where the municipalities 
joined forces – and funds – to test hail cannons pro-
duced by a local iron foundry to protect the extensive 
vineyards. Hupfer -
lem behind this trial: there is no control, and when-

deployments, a wide range of alternative interpreta-
tions were always at hands. And thus the government 

experiment.

Hupfer
in the book title may be somewhat misleading: her 
research also covers the period before 1860 – the 
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year when the Swiss Academy of Sciences decided to 
organize meteorological observation in a systematic 
country-wide network of sites – and some aspects be-
yond 1914, which are important to understand the 
main period of development of the present-day Swiss 
weather service. The book is well written, and a plea-

sure to read for everyone interested in science history 
and the challenge to bridge between pure science and 
a wider societal relevance of meteorological and cli-
matological observations in Switzerland.

Werner Eugster (Zürich)


